102
APPENDIX VII

THE CONSTITUTION (FORTH AMENDMENT) ACT, 1975
ACT NO. I1 OF 1975
[25th January. 1975]

An Act further to amend certain provisions of the Constitution
of the People’s Republic of Bangladesh

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend certain provisions of the Constitution of
the People's Republic of Bangladesh for the purposes hereinafter appearing ;

It is hereby enacted as follows —

1. Short title—This Act may be called the Constitution ( Fourth Amendment )
Act, 1975.

2. Amendment of article 11 of the Constitution—In the Constitution of the
People's Republic of Bangladesh, hereinafter referred to as the Constitution, in article
11, the comma and words ", and in which effective participation by the pcople through
their clected representatives in administration at all levels shall be cnsured” shall be
omitted.

3. Substitution of article 44 of the Constitution—In the Constitution, for
article 44 the lollowing shall be substituted, namely :—

"44. Enforcement of fundamental rights—Parliament may by law establish a
constitutional court, tribunal or commission for the enforcement of the rights conferred

by this Parl.".

4. Amendment of Part IV of the Constitution—In the Constitution, in Part
vV —

(a) for Chapters Iand Il the following shall be substituted, namely :—
"CHAPTER I—THE PRESIDENT AND VICE-PRESIDENT

48. The President—{1) There shall be a President of Bangladesh who shall be
clected in accordance with law by direct election.

(2) The President shall, as Head of State, take precedence over all other persons
in the State.

49. The Vice-President—There shall be a Vice-President of Bangladesh who
shall be appointed by the President.



Yol

AfafHz—q
el (e TTEE) WA, vvae
399¢ AT 2 T TEA
[2eT SErED, shacl
AelefETTE] N T ey [
HLATT GORTy 2E I

gy fealfe Srripmz-mawE ddwEeal AR Ediee sfeem
R Sifdesen AL ARG ¢ rarea,

TS SRl i o3 T4 239 5

S | Terg RIRAMT - «@F EA AR (5ed AEHIEE) WEA, dva¢ T SfEs
234 |

2| ALRATTTR 5y SR AL |— AASTSR AT HefqI= (Sregod
et e wfefRe)-ga vy wrmmE ‘G e wEe s feffee
fSffETTa T s FEa Tgdered Five 33" el e 28

0 | AT 88 SrRa Afegiem - WefHag 88 SrEmE AfAre fEg
88 IRy 2fegiHs 231 o

“88 | CITE® wfE=Ia T 1— 92 Ot awg AfEEREz TR FEE &
ALY, TR A= 991 A wmee, iRy weE e afefre sfite
#fRTET 17 |

8 | TR T2 ST FGHI [ AL ved Bitsl,
(=) 5% ¢ 27 ~ifwwEE #fRs Faset 37 ¢ 33+ afogife 23 ¢
“1 #Afmm-alg=ifs ¢ Bot-aig-ifs

8b 1 FEARS - (3) TR e qEAfS A, TR aers FdieE
M SEAE Fifee 230 |

(2) B TGS T o T Ghew Tred B S SR |

85 | TA-AEHAs IqieETieT aeen Se-agefs e, R agefs sge
e 28



103

50.  Qualifications for clection as President and appointment as Vice-
President.—A person shall not be qualified for election as President or appointment as
Vice-President it he—

(a) is less than thirty-five years of age ; or
(b) is not qualified for election as a member of Parliament ; or

(¢) has been removed from the office ol President or Vice-President under
this Conslitution.

provisions ol this Constitution, a President shall hold office for a term of five years
from the date on which he enters upon his olfice :

51. Term of office of President and Vice-President—(1) Subject to the

Provided that, notwithstanding the expiration of his term., a President shall
continue to hold office until his successor enters upon his office.

(2) A Vice-President shall, unless sooner removed from his office by the
President, hold office for a term of five years from the date on which he enters upon his
office.

(3) A President may resign his office by writing under his hand addressed to the
Vice-Presiden! and a Vice-President may resign his office by writing under his hand
addressed to the President.

(4) A President or a Vice-President shall not, during his term of office, be
qualified for election as a member ol Parliament, and if a member ol Parliament is
elected as President or appointed as Vice-President, he shall be deemed to have vacated
his seal in Parliament on the date on which he enters upon his office as President or

_ Vice-President.

52. Immunity of President and Vice-President—(1) Without prejudice to the
provisions of article 53, a President or a Vice-President shall not be answerable in any
court for anything done or omitted by him in the exercise or purported exercise of the
functions of his office, but this clause shall not prejudice the right of any person to take
proceedings against the Government.

(2)  During his term of office no criminal proceedings whatsoever shall be
instituted or continued against a President or a Vice-President in, and no process lor his
arrest or imprisonment shall issue from, any court.

53. lmpeachment of President—1) A President may be impeached on a
charge of violating this Constitution or of grave misconduct, preferred by a notice of
motion signed by not less than two-thirds of the total number of members of Parliament
and delivered to the Speaker, setting out the particulars of the charge, and the motion
shall not be debated earlier than fourteen nor later than thirty days after the notice is so
delivered ; and the Speaker shall forthwith summon Parliament if it is not in session.



300

o AgATe FEihe g29@ aae To-a@+fs fge 23w @rrs) | @@ Tfe
qGeife Fdifve 239 wi9al T21-ag+fe fige 23a@ @i 2309 1, afq fef

(F)  sfafe IEs =9 9UF T | S
() Ao Fifes w5 coi = = S

(o) wune @3 AR S FEATS WA Tei-aigofen om qdre welfe
229! A |

&> | TEAS ¢ BoAt-ABATS ol cwEm - (3) W% AR REEA-eTE
qiF+ife FaoR agrer SifE 130 A6 I T S ot Sidie Aifkae

T *F AT @, ARATET ATrE G (1 29Tl oge SIEE S e
&e =1 @l #rfe fofd W wmm agim Alfra |

(2) 9BAT FE Siga oM 2ECS R WIS A EA A Seagefew
o amem wikd 230 A6 9eEE (T ST o Sfde 2feEe |

(0) Tol-aEeilen Srwear ArFagE Aard 74T g9 7igsifen Tw Areage
A@Ae! So-AEefoa A om o wace #HifaE |

(8) TF+TS w2ar To-AEAS S TESHFIE APW-wen FHdibe w3am @
B A, 992 (@ AT 73 Fifte far So-aiRHfs e wgm aEefe
Feeat So-aigsifome Siam e s e 7G0T SR S <=1 AR 5i¢4r 230 |

¢ 1 7EATS e To-AFefen wiEgfE - (b) @2 W eo SR = A
51T e w4 g3rec @, ageife G Se-aEefs ser vty o sfire
gl sl fram e 1 s difer @ T s ofeE o o e e
TMETS TEEME FEe 2309 A, ©@ 93 Al e e adr g @
ayfea wifdeia =Fe wfawa = |

(2) TFefe a1 Toi-agafen sfoqana Su[ J@vs @F SMiETs @ 456
CETETET T WTEE 9 A 5 A TR A @3 SR @R 4 FREEE O
Elngekenicinip ke siki ol

o FEefen sfeerd — () @3 YW TR q eFed SPWBELE
sifeaie wg=fers wfgweie w91 T30s #iffta ; T2@ T AL (W6 Tw0-5_T4
S GRS e S sfecaiei fReee e sl G deE @i
=AEIEd G oM FEre 220 ; ~AeiEd Fws sga @ifo emitTs e 230e ¢w
ot = 91 T e 1 @2 e sieEee 220s =i 1, @3 wiow s =
ST =i SGEC 7 S S §



104

(2) The conduct of the President may be referred by Parliament to any tribunal
appointed by Parliament for the investigation ol a charge under this article.

(3) The President shall have the right to appear and (o be represented during the
consideration of the charge.

(4) II after the consideration of the charge a resolution is passed by Parliament by
the votes of not less than three-fourths of the total number of members declaring that
the charge has been substantiated, the President shall vacate his office on the date on
which the resolution is passed.

54. Removal of President on ground of incapacity.—(1) A President may be
removed [rom office on the ground of physical or mental incapacity on a motion ol
which notice, signed by not less than two-thirds of the total number of members of
Parliament. is delivered to the Speaker, setting out particulars of the alleged incapacity.

(2) On receipt of the notice the Speaker shall forthwith summon Parliament if it
is ot in session and shall call for a resolution constituting a medical board (hereafter in
this article called "the Board"), and upon the necessary motion being made and carried
shall forthwith cause a copy ol the nolice 1o be transmitted to the President together
with a request signed by the Speaker that the President submit himself within a period
of ten days [rom the date of the request to an examination by the Board.

(3) The motion for removal shall not be put to the vote earlier than fourteen nor
later than thirty days after notice of the motion is delivered to the Speaker, and il it is
again necessary lo summon Parliament in order to enable the motion to be made within
that period, the Speaker shall summon Parliament.

(4) The President shall have the right to appear and to be represented during the
consideration of the motion.

(5) If the President has not submitted himself to an examination by the Board
before the motion is made in Parliament, the motion may be put to the vote, and if it is
passed by the votes of not less than three-fourths of the total number of members of
Parliament, the President shall vacate his office on the date on which the motion is
passed.

(6) If before the motion for removal is made in Parliament the President has
submilted himself o an examination by the Board, the motion shall not be put to the
vole until the Board has been given an opportunity of reporting its opinion to
Parliament.

(7) 1 after consideration by Parliament of the motion and of the report of the
Board (which shall be submitted within seven days of the examination held pursuant to
clause (2) and if not so submitted shall be dispensed with) the motion is passed by the
voles of not less than three-fourths of the total number of members of Parliament, the
President shall vacate his office on the date on which the resolution is passed.



08

(3) @3 oEvEcE SR (F WA SRed T AGY F5e FEE @
BiEgriEa =G Aoy AEfen WHad ¢T6a Ples AT |

() wifetst-fArasisie sfifen Taifge difear 9y afefRfg-camas sfgsE
THTA |

(8) =S Rravare 74 (i - s1ede S foa-pedied (oG el a4
Ffera ATl i AW (T 4wzl TR 2w i 22w o qMEeie Am
T 28 |

€8 | SEdrE T ARAReT WoRTEd - (3) “TRifEE W Wb sEidE
ST FGefors SEM oW 23re weEfEe w4 TiEre HIffd ; 23R o AeTwE T
TR WA GE-SORICA ARE I Wi fwe @ s 9wt
eRETAR (NG ~Areea Fies e wfire 230

(%) wem afirrmas [ AfFE @ ety AR Fer SfieE S
S g9 9T BieT- iy (Torm 93 wwwem Al qfEm wieiEe)-eE
EREI S G 3¢ ATAGA 21 G ¢ 77 2qa[ 47 ~HAwH sewdls Te
Fifbea gt afef aBofen e @med 998 skuar e oEE Fke | 3 aof
AT Sl TP FEEE [, SR S-S wiEd 230wl e S
AZfs @ ot 6 ~16ifre 23317 & 8oy %

(9) SRR O SREIEE (G A 6 ewitg #E 2308 it
o 1 fal fare o el oI Giedt AR A, U9 EEA (VTR W SRR
* BT T AT A SN ST 2305 A A S B |

(8) oS Rl 2RI TEAE BofEe AR @y feRf-comTa
g Afea |

(@) er=lB nemm Seieem i Aig=ifs - wE ~Aifre 222 T Eefge |
2371 Aifere eRft (S (el TETS S " O ATTE (715 FA0-1e4TE S foe-
Tgdie (S5 Ol S TR AERG 8T 22TE T FEARE oA 4 230 |

() SRR e guRT wene Seifre 22am o aBefs crdma fast
[ fire 239 s TAe 23 9 Aema TR i mE Teme (o HiEEE e
A CTeq S ATRMG (SN REH WIE A |

(2) 71oM Teo dBRT ¢ ofa fee (T @3 Spmmad (]) WIS
A AS e W wifde A T3 @92 SReSd WRE 9 e 22 e
Fravra ararem 23 ) [afbe 23399 R wee @6 FEr-RdE S fea-
vgdied cerS ergtaf j8e 23 Wiz 8 234 ificd qgeifon o 5 23 |



105

55. Acting President.—(1) If a vacancy occurs in the office of President or if the
President is unable to discharge the functions of his office on account of absence,
illness or any other cause, the Vice-President shall act as President until a new President
elected to fill such vacancy enters upon his office or until the President resumes the
functions of his office, as the case may be.

(2) Atany time when both the offices of President and Vice-President are vacant
or when both the President and Vice-President are unable to discharge the functions ol
their respective olfices on account of absence, illness or any other cause, the Speaker
shall act as President until a new President elected or Vice-President appointed to [ill
such vacancy enters upon his office or until the President or the Vice-President resumes
the functions of his office, as the case may be.

(3) Parliament may make such provisions as it thinks fit for the discharge of the
functions of President in any contingency not provided for in this article.

56. Executive authority of the Republic.—(1) The executive authority of the
Republic shall vest in the President and shall be exercised by him, cither directly or
through oificers subordinate to him, in accordance with this Constitution.

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in clause (1), the Vice-President may
exercise such power of the President as the President may, by order, specify.

(3) All executive action of the Government shall be expressed to be taken in the
name of the President.

(4) The President shall, by rules, specify the manner in which orders and other
instruments made in his name shall be attested or authenticated, and the validily of any
order or instrument so attested or authenticated shall not be questioned in any court on
the ground that it is not duly made or executed.

(5) The President shall make rules for the allocation and transaction of the
business of the Government.

57. Power of President to grant pardons, etc—The President shall have power
Lo grant pardons, reprieves and respites, and to remit, suspend or commule any sentence
passed by any court, tribunal or other authority.

CHAPTER II—THE COUNCIL OF MINISTERS

58. Council of Minister.—(1) There shall be a Council of Ministers to aid and
advise the President in the exercise of his functions.

(2) The question whether any, and if so what, advice was tendered by the Council
ora Minister to the President shall not be inquired into in any court.



So¢

¢ | EE AR - (3) ABeFER w9 T el wefEls, SerEel 1 @
CE A AEAS wifng A s 230e (Fawe AT Fdite Jed Tigefe
FideE g 7 F91 w99 o g gran e FeE gz 7 w9 o Be-aEife
FE=ifee S ShEea |

(2) GlF 71E BTS¢ Boi-7geifs Tormm om 7y 230 fredl qEeAs qag T
Al o3 e, STgel A O (@ TR W Al e e w2ge
craEs W e Tou qgefe TRem ard 1 w4 vde el a@ets qr T
aig=ife “arg e Frfem azel 71 w1 Jfw ~AreE qgeifeaee S sk |

(0) (FIA AR CFE % SR Aigeeq Wity e @i [{em A A
W (Al ETE WA T, (R fieEal aaws wfacs fice |

@b | AEretEd S F9Y - (5) enrerad MR Fey sEaten $aw W 23
92 93 W SR TR TYe wiy derweld S ©igE wias S5EE
W T BELA |

(2) (5) W=@ TE T T3A0E, TR ge AGARS @ WIS, OiFE WA 2l
Frdrae sfaram, $o-agefe alg-foa 2 =) g sfve «fhEd |

(@) s w2 ey aigeitea w3 2gaie A A T 2a |

(8) TEARTA w &ds WTTEME ¢ S Heda el wrenfis =1 andigs
239, T o Rz wm fdwe e g3e wEEeie werifie 91 audise
. G S A pEsm wdmdeE adre a1 e 7@ R I erEw @hel weE
R SAECS eng BL1=i T A2 A |

(@) AGIE FFial FEen A% @ ARSETE Ty [T gedma Sk |

@9 | AR T e Tonifig Sff - @ SmEs, BRIAE A SE @
TEAF FES oMY (@ (FF ST WAl FEra ¢ s Sga s g @ @ 9w
g, Fe 91 25 TRk wiel AEeifoa ik |

o #ifiTrEE -

e | War-AREE - (3) qEeferE OrE wile o TEEel FfEaE a9
AR e 0! Al wAfEm AifEE )

(2) Afmw a1 w& 7gefsrs siwn @wE e st & W, 9w s
Aifrer & e v sfes, mwmﬁmmmwaﬁr
s =y



106

(3) The President shall, in his discretion, appoint Irom among the members
of Parliament or persons qualified to be clected as members of Parliament, a Prime
Minister and such other Ministers, Ministers of State and Deputy Ministers as he deems
necessary :

Provided that a Minister of State or Deputy Minister shall not be a member of the
Council.

(4) The President shall preside at the meetings of the Council or may direct the
Vice-President or Prime Minister to preside al such meetings.

(5) The Ministers shall hold office during the pleasure of the President.

(6) A Minister may resign his office by writing under his hand addressed to the
President,
riicle "Minister” includes a Prime Minister, Minister ol State and
cand

(7) In this
Deputy Minister.

(b) Chapter III shall be omitted.

5. Amendment of article 66 of the Constitution—In the Constitution, in article
66—

(a) in clause (2),

(i) in sub-clause (¢), after the semi-colon at the end, the word "or" shall be
inserted ; and

(ii)  sub-clause (1) shall be omitted ; and
(b) clause (3) shall be omitted.

6. Amendment of article 67 of the Constitution—In the Constitution, in article
67, in clause (1), in sub-clause (a), the words "before Parliament” shall be omitted.

7. Substitution of article 70 of the Constitution.—In the Conslitution, for
article 70 the following shall be substituted, namely —

"70. Vacation of seat on resignation, etc.—A person clected as a member of
Parliament at an election at which he was nominated as a candidate by a political party
shall vacate his seat if he resigns from that party or votes in Parliament against that
party.

Explanation.—If a member of Parliament—
(a) being present in Parliament abstains from voting, or
(b) absents himsell from any sitting of Parliament, ignoring the direction of

the party which nominated him at the election as a candidate not to do
s0, he shall be deemed to have voted against that party.".



sou

(9) FFfs ©ER RTIGAR ASTA- TR T4 2200 (6L ALW-Too 2297
el AFEAET Y 2RCE aFEH qENal @9 5 @ SR W SR oiEwe!
S AT, Afe-wEl ¢ SA-waEr e sfaa

OF ¥ AT A, (@ fs-Ta a1 Gowal AfEEa e 22@ Al

(8) B~ AR o welvifey Ffita wwal fofd & == w1y THi-ag-fe
AR AGTAE ASATeg Fars e e «fifiT |

(@) Tt AZ=EA FCSRTAET TAGIAN *E A I T2 AR |

(b) FEATST SrRTH ArFAYE AT I WA R AW Sylet e i

(9) «@F SEEE “War” IR qma), dfe-val ¢ Tl SeYE | @9
(4) wa ~ifawer Ree 23

@ | TR W SRR T |- FLILIAT b SIqHEA,—

(F) () 7R~

(=) (8) BoA-wwly GRIEFEEE o9 “a2q” w6 Agafee 23W
G

(S)  (5) Bol-m e 23 @1
(%) (o) 7w REe VA |

b | TSI 90 STrvEmE AfSgied |-—ARaTTa o0 oqwEme  ARacs FEEs
90 S[CvEn efegIfre 2303 &

“qo | AeRst FeTifit Sl WA ¥ 26W (—@F FHEE @F aRtAfss W
atdfiwee s 23w W e Fem-a e 23w ol afn e we 23te
Aeyisl TR, WA TG T Wi [{AUE (SIF W $aA, SR 220E FETM SRR
S *F BRI

AT - AW I TEW-ATT, @ e BRie Fise andtmee Wt S,
1% wees o ey wfim—

(F) Tom Beifyge AfFar ol Wi REe AR, wig

(¥) SOTF @ @S TAES Aned, ol BE o e wee RS
ColGwI SR™iTe 3 ey 283 17



107

8. Amendment of article 72 of the Constitution.—In the Constitution, in article
72, in clause (1), for the proviso the following shall be substituted, namely -

"Provided that there shall be at least two sessions of Parliament in every year.”.

9. Insertion of new article 73A in the Constitution.—In the Constitution, after
article 73, the following new article 73A shall be inserted, namely :—

"T3A. Rights of Ministers as respects Parliament—(1) Every Minister shall
have the right to speak in, and otherwise to take part in the proceedings of, Parliament,
but shall not be entitled to vote unless he is a member of Parliament also.

(2) In this article, "Minister" includes a Prime Minister, Minister of State and
Deputy Minister.".

10.  Amendment of article 74 of the Constitution—In the Constitution, in
article 74, in clause (3), for the words "exercising the functions of the" the words
"acting as” shall be substituted.

I1. Amendment of article 76 of the constitution—In the Constitution, in
article 76, in clause (1), the words "AlL its first meeting in each session" shall be
omitted.

12, Amendment of article 80 of the Constitution—In the Constitution, in
article 80, in clause (3), after the words "assent (o the Bill" the words "or declare that he
wilhholds assent therefrom” shall be inserted.

13, Amendment of article 88 of the Constitution—In the Constitution, in
article 88, after clause (a), the following new clause shall be inserted, namely —

"(aa) the remuncration payable to the Vice-President and other expenditure
relating to his office ;"

14, Amendment of article 95 of the Constitution—In the Constitution, in
article 95, for clause (1) the following shall be substituted, namely :—

"(1) The Chief Justice and other judges shall be appointed by the President.”.

15. Amendment of article 96 of the Constitution—In the Constitution, in
article 96,

{a) Tor clause (2) the following shall be substituted, namely :—

"(2) A judge may be removed from his office by order of the President on the
ground of misbehaviour or incapacity :
Provided that no judge shall be removed until he has been given a
reasonable opportunity of showing cause against the action proposed to be taken in
regard to him." ; and

(b) clause (3) shall be omitted.



55
2@ | FLRHICTA S0 SFUORTAR FALCHL (AL D200 WL, —
() (5)wFm,~

(=) wEE T e s e it e afegife 3w
LEH

(=) e Rege 239

(@) () 7 TwE e meE AR g e Mo wwels
afegifie 230 |

b | R a8 SreEtad efegiva-TREtTE vx8 wervEE  afaars
fmael v28 SrEmd afeg+e 230 8

“328 | Fodiom oo AoRa s Qe et 1—ag ARl [RaeE-
HACATTE AT SN2 T

(%) colbR-sifFs sgesad ;
()  wemora FEIbeR R e wERsE S R
() e S  we

(7)  #Eefe-swa PP T @9 ASTAR IUAG AT T efraEary
Ty e wgefe-vrm Rl Ao e e @ e
wfEs FifEs s far Ram aee sfaes oifda 17

29 | LI 38 5T TR T | —ALIHEE 38T TuRtid (3) W&l
*o1eefs e 23

o | FIYITTA 389 SHUHEAE AR I-LRLTH 389 SCEAE (8) WEHE
(F) Bomwia =7 Faa Tom So-ww Hyifes 32 3

“(FF)  BATEAfs,”

2 | TR S8L SRR AT IR 38y SRR () AEE
e, (B A (12 e B “eidard Tee 7 230 el e 230

wo | AR &GSty wwfnem e |—wfdieTe T8n wofe fege 23 |



309

q | ANty SIEETME MG - AT 92 SEmEEE (3) wEE
“Sieraa Afars s “sied alfeg)fe 230 3

BT 4 AT (@, 4TS 997 HAONHY WEwg FIG! ST 2309 17 |

b | HfILITT T Q0T A[OoaWd ALAIE |— T Qo Toeme « FEast
T QU SRR AN 220 ¢

"o | AGT FEATE TAATTE AT 1— (3) AT TG ASTH TG0] FACS
O TS 22 FREAICe Sigterzd Sve sifEwE 230@, o 1 fof wem-ven
1 %, ©iEr 230w e celbwm s #iifdca= 1

(%) % SrpEeEy “WED IS g a8, Af-TE ¢ Be-NE weyE (7

5| AU 98 SR YT — WU a8 wmmme (o) WEE
‘e Wi e AfeE” mef v “agefeme o s wwefE
effeg|fre 230 |

So | ALIATFA Qv TERIAT R |- AP Qv SR (3) WA
AR Aer SIfatE A4 tasts” Ml e 23w

3| LAY bro SHLBEIAE AN - AL o ST (9) WER
“wrafent SREE" wwelEm ow “Fel erEwe wfonim fae aftem s e
wfarga” *wefE e 230 |

53 | LAY by STrEAE AN |- AR by SR (F) WEE 0E
fwael =g Wl SeCAiiere 2309 8

“(@%) Tol-agsfers o Aifufis ¢ orm vew e s 9,7

30 | ALY b Trorma AT - AR ve SEmEmE (3) wed
“ifare st (3) weel afegife 23 ¢

*(5) @ faprmefe aae Sy e qEHfs woe Fye =8 1 |
58 | ALITTR » SHLERTTA T 1— TR S TIwe,—
(F) (2) v “ifFars fFmael (2) vl efiszii@s 33 ¢

() SEMIBEE A SR TR qEefeT wor wE G el SR o
2306 WeHifTS ] A3 ¢

BTE A€ ANE @, @ [vEee $EE T aufte 9 gwds Revw s
WA Yfestrs SRS T w9 S SRE S wha aEE A7 ) 99t

(=) (o) werl e 23ca |



108

16. Amendment of article 98 of the Constitution.—In the Constitution, in article
98, the commas and words ", after consultation with the Chiel Justice," shall be
omitted.

17. Substitution of article 102 of the Constitution.—In the Constitution, for
article 102 the following shall be substituted, namely :—

"102. Power of High Court Division to issue certain orders and directions,
ete.—(1) The High Court Division may, il satisfied that no other equally efficacious
remedy is provided by law—

{a) on the application of any person aggrieved, make an order—

(i) directing a person performing any functions in connection with the
affairs of the Republic or of a local authorily, to refrain from doing
that which he is not permitted by law to do or to do that which he is
required by law to do ; or

(ii) declaring that any act done or proceeding taken by a person
performing functions in connection with the alfairs of the Republic or
of a local authority has been done or taken withoul lawful authority,
and is ol no legal effect ; or

(b) on the application of any person, make an order—

(i) directing that a person in custody be brought before it so that it may
satisfy itsclf that he is not being held in custody without lawful
authority or in an unlawlul manner ; or

(ii)  requiring a person holding or purporting to hold a public office to
show under what authority he claims to hold that office.

(2)  Notwithstanding anything contained in clause (1), the High Court Division
shall have no power under this article to make an interim order or to pass any order in
relation to any law Lo which article 47 applies.

(3) In this article, unless the context otherwise requires, "person” includes a
statutory public authority and any court or tribunal, other than a court or tribunal
established under a law relating to the defence services of Bangladesh or any
disciplined force or a tribunal to which article 117 applies.”.

18.. Amendment of article 109 of the Constitution.—In the Constitution, in
article 109, the words "and tribunals” shall be omitted.

19. Substitution of article 115 of the Constitution.—In the Constitution, in
article 115 the following shall be substituted, namely :—



Sob

5S¢ AT Sb TIRAE IR 1-HUAd s oubEAE SYH
favraeifen wifzs ~mtmd S el e 28

SU | MR dod SRR AfSFIN - WefAdiEa Yo WwbEE AREE
ool yox e afegiie 22 ¢

“so3 | Floom SoT ¢ o el witra oFm 2R Rewem wwel 1-(3)
TErals [owsn s 1 eRaaTea dSHEE T (A, WEE AE SE @
srEEe g w91 23 A1, Ol 180

(¥) ¢ @ ATH Ve ST

(o) emred A @R FAT FEUcE [FEEREE ARe AdEE @ @
wifrgetieT 7o Afers @R wd Sie 79, 919 @H T
-9l 230w faws @fiae o R si3e@ a@l oreE 39w I
Ffaaa o [ ewE @), sidd

(=) ered 41 (@ FAE FeeTE REmRan e afEHE @ @n
nfgAEE T© Tew F© @ T A e @H S
SRS Tog et T TRATE T 73S ITATE ¢ BT @I
wiEeTe FHTe ME I TR SR bw e wormE
Ffacs A ; 59|l

(A) @ G AT AT

(=) wiEPEe w9y yfews 9 @EET TA @R TiErT 4T
w5 [l 7@ A% 9w AEee e Renem e Aremseeng
S 2ETS #{10d, (12 &) %A WioT T@ iers T e
T ST e o S, S9E

(S @ AR o S S i Rete @m afers ol
@ FegarE wEEel e i Wik skrete, ol
T ol S SRErs wAfEE |
(2) (3) wwim W <@ RN, Wil Aoge YI@OE FEwE @W swde!
STPWIGR 41 @B FefEditd 8 SR ey T4, AIRH (P I CRE T8N
SRS SAl (I ST ! A A | )

(10 @I ST Ty N 2307 3 SRy e afcs AdRfias weerdl
ST ¢ IR afeTE FHRSHIE W R e AR wiEeE
wA efefie @M TES T GEgEE Tere a0 FRATTE 539 W ATIey
T, A3HA @ SEGEE TEE @ @ WS [ SR Sees 2851 1T

391 ST Sob TR AL I— TG Sob THAT “WTETS @
SRy W Afers emiETed” Wt efogifre 23w 1

Sbr | SRR Sy Srqeread efeEiee (- AR Sve SRR AfFare
e yve SR afegii+e 2309 8



109

"115. Appointments to subordinate courts.~Appointments of persons to offices
in the judicial service or as magistrates exercising judicial functions shall be made by
the President in accordance with rules made by him in that behall.".

20. Amendment of article 116 of the Constitution.—In the Constitution, in
article 116, for the words "Supreme Court” the word "President” shall be substituted.

21. Insertion of new article 116A in the Constitution.—In the Constitution, in
Part VI, in Chapter II, after article 116, the following new article 116A shall be
inserted, namely —

"116A. Judicial officers to be independent in the exercise of their functions.—
Subject to the provisions of the Constitution, all persons employed in the judicial
service and all magistrates shall be independent in the exercise of their judicial
functions.”.

22. Amendment of article 117 of the Constitution.—In the Constitution, in

article 117, in clause (1), in sub-clause (c), for the figure "3" the figure "2" shall be
substituted.

23. Insertion of new Part VIA in the Constitution.—In the Constitution, after
Part VI, the following new Part VIA shall be inserted, namely :—

"PART VIA
THE NATIONAL PARTY

117A. National Party.—(1) If the President is satisfied that with a view to giving
full effect to any of the fundamental principles of state policy set out in Part II of
this Constitution it is necessary so to do, he may, by order, direct that there shall be
only one political party in the State (hereinafter referred o as the National Party).

(2) When an order is made under clause (1), all political parties in the State shall
stand dissolved and the President shall take all steps necessary for the formation of the
National Party.

(3)  All matters relating to the nomenclature, programme, membership,
organisation, discipline, finance and function of the National Party shall be determined
by order made by the President.

(4) Subject to the order made by the President under clause (3), a person in the
service of the Republic shall be qualified to be a member of the National Party.



Sos

“sye | W wmETe et —fomfedin e oW ferfedn
wifgeemsE s i g F9e Te Srary ddre ffwnr swad a@-fe
fewe s 7

3o | ALAGTT So0 TR ATAIE |—TREIT S5 SEeeRas A
cFitER” =l sffars “alg«fea” «mor afewi#se 23w |

30 | FEALITT TST 36T YRR G (AT T W 27 “iRova
3 M SHTHEAE “ RS T 55U Smen Al fErs 230 8

“yyus | FrsrafEstii SR Rotaer 1w o FEE -9 AEGEE
g is vl eifen fge afend «3e wifaEsad FeEse e o
R = (7

2y | FLALITAT 359 TR NS ST vy SIERE () TEE (1)
BA-TETE “0” FeEIE A <) ey afewfee 8 |

33 | TR T THF I ALAE | T Sl oF Frer o
Y% 7 ALAETS 2309 3

e S

IS wE

39T | EET W (—(5) wgeifen B 1 AemerTe S| SSivuE T @ @3
AefFaiE 591 oRel 9 7 sfasEEe JEteTyes @ W «at! Afardens seTa
A SR S S AW, o) 23 fof, wivet a, Fm e sifdee o
ANE By GT5] TS Hel (STozHd Tisr we Ay wfefie) e |

(R) B9 (5) 7ol ST @ AN 4TS T, SUE AGT AT AGCASP 7
S %@ @qe RS SO WA s6 FEAE O STAGEE TG AMURA R
T |

(9) SO W AR, FED, FefE, HeiA, YR, TEEE @93 FeT
'8 wifirg TifFe sl faaw a@efeq oot il fdifrs 23w

(8) (o) W ol 2B TEe afte ST SEetEe T Y
Fife @S Wi T 23 (e 230 |



110

(5) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Constitution, when the National
Party is formed, a person shall-

{a) in the case he is a member of Parliament on the date the National Party is
formed, cease to be such member, and his seat in Parliament shall
become vacant, if he does not become a member of the National Party
within the time fixed by the President ;

(b) not be qualified for election as President or as a member of Parliament
il he is not nominated as a candidate for such election by the National
Party ;

(¢) have no right to form, or be a member or otherwise take part in the
activities of, any political party other than the National Party.

(6) An order made under this article shall remain in force until revoked by a
subsequent order.".

24. Amendment of article 119 of the Constitution.—In the Constitution, in
article 119, in clause (1)~

(a) for the words and commas "all elections to Parliament, the conduct of
such elections and of elections to the office of President," the words "all
clections to the office of President and to Parliament and the conduct of
such elections” shall be substituted ; i

(b) in clause (b), the word "and" shall be omitted ; and
(c) for clause-(c) the following shall be substituted, namely :—

“(c) delimit the constituencies for the purposes of elections to
Parliament ; and

(d) prepare electoral rolls for the purposes of elections to the office of
President and to Parliament.".

25. Amendment of article 122 of the Constitution.—~In the Constitution, in
article 122,~

(a) in clause (1), after the word "elections” the words "to the office of
President and" shall be inserted ; and

(b} after clause (2), the following new clause shall be added, namely :—

"(3) A person shall be entitled to be enrolled on the electoral roll for the
purposes ol elections to the office of President if he is entitled to be enrolled on the
electoral roll for a constituency under clause (2).".



o

(@) @2 FR4 T TN 2ZARG ©F TGe TH WO 7 S 7w, T4 &
Fjfe—

(=) uf foff, @ wifitd wreta v+ 7w, 12 Sifftd, AEW-AT AT,
w7 23 fof qigafs ode e smom Wy e weE W |l
T30 FEA-AGA] AR T 7L AGTR SR ST %7 2209 ;

() =l fofr wrdiy weemm T 7l a Ao PR aidfme Ters
T =, Sig 2B wEEe e a@Hf @ wemomn e 23am
1ol 22 A

(%) ESTE W TG S (I ARG Wel Ao FladiE q el Weerd WA
23914 F5eq1 SFed SEH WiEd SNl Sedaze SEae siEwE i
Fecc il

() 2 SRR SR AT (1N ST AT @1 S wEl genigE T zed
“fi® 9e1ae AFE 17 1

20 | ALIHTR 355 FAWEWR ALCNET |- FLILTTT S o SIUBRDTd () WEE,—

(F) " WS 160 & (SIbIE-SlFs d@eaaed TRy, o ¢
fragd a9z Soae e ¢ qEefE A smeEm efiEacs agets-
AR 6 AT I [EIBTT &) (SIBTH-SIFP HFOFAAT TG,
e @ fRgae wae sl el alfegife 23 ;

(4)  (4) woiE “93e” =wb! [{ee 2309 ; W9
() (o) et siffacs fam () q9e (1) nel afegife 23
“(oh) AT B Ee oAl @Ea A e s ; a9e

(7) #gefo-stma gt e FHveE ww o eBE-SEE owe
I

28 | FLIYITTT SRR STRTR AL - 22 S ,—

(@) () 7R “elbifiiern-fefes” *wim @ “qAgefe-~mma 8" *mnefd
FAYIfEs 2304 ; ¥de
() (R) vER o FEmet To7 wel AgAies 280 ¢
“o) @ ofe I@AAfS-sti fdivee T (ool iy 23 wifdsal

&0, A B (R) W 9@ @F R @R EhEelEeee 2R S
=7



11

26. Amendment of article 123 of the Constitution.—In the Constitution, in
article 123,—

(a) inclause (1),—

(i) for the words "ninety days" the words "one hundred and eighty days"
shall be substituted ; and

(i) the proviso shall be omitted ; and

(b) in clause (2), for the words "ninety days" the words "one hundred and
eighty days" shall be substituted.

27. Substitution of article 124 of the Constitution.—In the Conslitution, for
article 124 the following shall be substituted, namely —

124, Parliament may make provision as to elections.—Subject to the provisions
of this Constitution, Parliament may by law make provision with respect to all matters

relating to, or in connection with, elections to the office of President or to Parliament,
including—

(a) the preparation of electoral rolls ;
(b) in the case of elections to Parliament, the delimitation of constituencies ;
(¢) the holding of elections ; and

(d) all other matters necessary for securing the elections to the office of
President and the due constitution of Parliament.”. '

28. Amendment of article 141A of the Constitution.—In the Constitution, in
article 14 1A, in clause (1), the proviso shall be omitted.

29. Amendment of article 147 of the Constitution.—In the Constitution, in
article 147, in clause (4), after sub-clause (a), the following new sub-clause shall be
inserted, namely —

“(aa) Vice-President ;”.
30. Amendment of article 148 of the Constitution.—In the Constitution, in
article 148, in clause (2), the words “and for any reason it is impracticable for the oath

{0 be made before that person” shall be omitted.

31. Omission of Second Schedule to the Constitution.—In the Constitution, the
Second Schedule shall be omitted.



112

32. Amendment of Third Schedule to the Constitution.—In the Constitution, in
the Third Schedule,—

(a) in form I, for the words “Chief Justice” the word “Speaker” shall be
substituted ;

(b) after form 1, the following new form shall be inserted, namely ;-

“1A. The Vice-President.—An oath (or affirmation) in the following form shall
be administered by the President—

e , do solemnly swear (or affirm) that I will faithfully
discharge the duties of the office of Vice-President of Bangladesh according to law :

That I will bear true faith and allegiance to Bangladesh :
That I will preserve, protect and defend the Constitution :

And that I will do right to all manner of people according to law, without fear or
favour, affection or ill-will.” ™ ;

(¢) in form 3, for the words “Chief Justice” the word “President” shall be
substituted ;

(d) in form 4, for the words “Chief Justice” the word “President” shall be
substituted ; and

(e) inform 5, the words “at a meeting of Parliament” shall be omitted.

33. Amendment of Fourth Schedule to the Constitution.—In the Constitution, in
the Fourth Schedule, paragraph 12 shall be omitted.

34. Extension of the term of the First Parliament.—Notwithstanding anything
contained in the Constitution, the Parliament functioning immediately before the
commencement of this Act shall, unless sooner dissolved by the President, stand
dissolved on the expiration of the period of five years from such commencement.

35. Special provisions relating to President.— Notwithstanding anything
contained in the Constitution, on the commencement of this Act,—

(a) the person holding office as President of Bangladesh immediately before
such commencement shall cease to hold, and vacate, the office of President of
Bangladesh ;

(b)  Bangabandhu Sheikh Mujibur Rahman, Father of the Nation, shall become,
and enter upon the office of President of Bangladesh and shall, as from such
commencement, hold office as President of Bangladesh as if elected to that office under
the Conslitution as amended by this Acl.



33
0 | TR TS SO T |- PO 0T, —

() > wEw “gum RERAfs” e sRRes e «wtl dfegife
A

(d) > T o FEEel Tow TN AUAfEre 2309 ¢

3% | BB A TET PR T weil (31 cre)-+i1d AfsiTe
2304 3

“aifa, , TEfeTE e (J1 wpeia cardl) sRrefe @,
aﬁwmmﬂwma@wﬁmwmwﬁ—mw

wif e oS SghaT R ¢ SigeTey (At i
it AT TR, FudT ¢ FaaFae ofe

@=e wify Sif a1 wwerg, SEAE T FEeE wEel T 22W weeE df wiga-
STl AAfaEs wwad F59 177

(1) T gy Fpmefs” smefm sffers “F@-fe” il afegife 22 ;
() 8 waCx "G faplaeifes” wmefm wfEars “agefs” w5 afsgife 23 ;

E
(®) ¢ Fa0 “ASTHA (FIF 2o wal e 23w
03 | g TR AT |- AR od SEFTEE v) S e 28 |

©0 | AW AT G e TR A T 234N, T Age R WA
S THEES E Wity e wem, qg6Afs qid st W afse, a2
o3 TS 220 A5 I walfEe 230 oI T3 |

08 | TS -Fee Res fRm TR Tl 991 233, o Arge 93 wiEy

(%) 42 T eESiE SEEEe A A e 2gefs-em wfife e,
i a@eifen =i AfZeam =1 «3e T3 = =75 2304 ;

(<) wifer Frei womy o1 fSE T FEATATE TEATS 220 99 AEARST
Brfem gz FEE qF T gFve 23re ol aemmred wigHfe-si qge difEan
@ ol @3 wnaee w weenfis Ryt wie agafs-sy i 23aed |



